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About us 

Balaji Metal Coating LLC Dubai has been established in 2022 by
Hiralal, Aaidan and Santosh. They have been working in Dubai
in the Interiors Decoration field for the past 10 year, They are
expert and has many awards in this field. They possesses an in-
depth knowledge in the This field and is a multi-tasking
personnel as well as problem solver, offering solutions
wherever required.

They are well known for sharing knowledge and expertise with
his subordinates and offers training as and when required. He
takes responsibilities for the entire process and remains
committed during the entire project as per client requirements
and ensures a timely handover and maintains high and quality
work.

We provide the following service : Gold Plating, Silver Plating,
Aluminium Anodizing, Tin Plating, Nickel Plating, Copper Plating,  
Chromate Conversion Coating, Passivation, Black Oxide
Coating, Etc.

Balaji  Metal Coating is Best Company in Coating and Plating
Field Because the Team Managment  have best Knowledge And
well Exprience



MANAGMENT TEAM 

Hiralal Jangir
Hiralal Jangir is a Director of Balaji Metal Coating LLC. And  He
is the Backbone of Balaji Metal Coating LLC. Hiralal have 10+
year experience in Interior designing Field and he take
knowledge from many comapnies in Dubai and He take many
Awards in different Field.

Aaidan Ram
Aaidan is second Director of Balaji Metal Coating LLC. and He is
the Most Important part of Balaji Metal Coating LLC. Aaidan
have 10+ Years experience in Interior designing field and He
take Knowledge from many reputed Companies of Dubai. He
Won many Awards in different Fields.

Santosh Nishad
Santosh is Third Director of Balaji Metal Coating LLC. Santosh is
also very important part of Balaji Metal Coating LLC. Santosh
have many knowledge in Different field. Santosh makes best
contribution to grow the company and provide best services to
clients.
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Contact Us

Address
Balaji Metal Coating LLC
Jabal Ali Industries Area-1
Dubai UAE

Contact No.

+971556893788

E-mail

info@balajimetalcoating.com

Website

www.balajimetalcoating.com


